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The Los Angeles Conservatory for the Arts is supposed to be a new beginning for Sadie Bryant. Moving
across the country is exactly what she needs to escape the gossip surrounding her injury, the devastating
betrayal of her ex-partner, and to rebuild her career as a solo dancer.

When the school announces that the annual Fall Showcase, a performance that secures a spot studying in
London, will now require each dancer to have a partner, Sadie's fresh start is a nightmare. Now she has to
dance with Luke Morrison, the school womanizer with a big ego. Sadie doesn't know how to trust Luke
enough to dance with him after her last partner left her broken, but Luke is determined to change that.

Then, The Hit List comes out. A game of sexual conquest where guys get points for all the girls they hook up
with--and it seems like every guy at the school is playing.

The girl worth the most points? Sadie
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From reader reviews:

William Lyons:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book The Hit List will make you to possibly be
smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think in
which open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they could be thought like
that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book with you?

James Batts:

This book untitled The Hit List to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that's because
when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in
the book shop or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason
for your requirements to past this reserve from your list.

Raymond Langford:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but in addition novel and The Hit List or others sources were
given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel need to read more and more.
Science reserve was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to increase their
knowledge. In other case, beside science guide, any other book likes The Hit List to make your spare time
much more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Andrea Behnke:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is
named of book The Hit List. You can include your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it
could possibly add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most essential that, you must
aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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