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This compendium brings together thirty-three murderous tales - one from each of the capital's boroughs - that
not only shocked the City but made headline news across the country. Throughout its history the great urban
sprawl of Greater London has been home to some of the most shocking murders in England, many of which
have made legal history. Contained within the pages of this book are the stories behind these heinous crimes.
They include George Chapman, who was hanged in 1903 for poisoning three women, and whom is widely
suspected of having been the notorious serial killer Jack the Ripper; lovers Edith Thompson and Frederick
Bywaters, executed for stabbing to death Thompson's husband Percy in 1922; and Donald Hume, who was
found not guilty of the murder of wealthy businessman Stanley Setty in 1949, but later confessed to killing
him, chopping up his body and disposing of it by aeroplane. Linda Stratmann also reveals previously
unpublished information that sheds a whole new light on the infamous Craig and Bentley case. This carefully
researched, well-illustrated and enthralling text will appeal to those interested in the history of Greater
London's history and true-crime fans alike.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Wilson:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Greater London Murders: 33 True Stories
of Revenge, Jealousy, Greed & Lust (Sutton True Crime History) will make you to be smarter. You can feel
more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think this open or reading a new
book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best
book or ideal book with you?

Amos Curley:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get
great deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will
say absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
are you experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited
right. Then do you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare
time, the actual book you have read is actually Greater London Murders: 33 True Stories of Revenge,
Jealousy, Greed & Lust (Sutton True Crime History).

Willard Edwards:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Greater London Murders: 33 True Stories of
Revenge, Jealousy, Greed & Lust (Sutton True Crime History), it is possible to enjoy both. It is excellent
combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind
hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Phyllis Granger:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Greater London Murders: 33 True Stories
of Revenge, Jealousy, Greed & Lust (Sutton True Crime History) can be the answer, oh how comes? The
new book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand-
new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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